Understanding Proposed 2024 Ohio Building, Mechanical & Plumbing Code Rules

The next Ohio Building (OBC), Mechanical (OMC) & Plumbing Codes (OPC) will be adopted by the Board
of Building Standards (Board) differently than previous code updates. The next OBC, OMC & OPC will be
based on the 2021 International Codes (I-Codes) published by the International Code Council (ICC). In
previous code cycles, the Board would duplicate model code language from the I-Codes into the Ohio
Administrative Code (OAC).

However, as part of Governor DeWine’s and Lt Governor Husted’s initiative to reform the OAC by targeting
duplicative provisions, outdated sections and unnecessary requirements, the Board will no longer
duplicate model code language unchanged by Ohio in the OBC, OMC & OPC rules. This means that the
proposed rules will look different than they have in the past, but once adopted the published OBC, OMC,
OPC code books — both online and in print — will look the same as they do today integrating both the

model code and Ohio modifications into cohesive documents.

Administrative Provisions & Rules of Construction

As Ohio code administration requirements are specific to Ohio law, the Board is not adopting the
provisions of Chapters 1 of the IBC, IMC & IPC. Proposed rule 4101:1-1-01 continues to specify the
administrative requirements for building code compliance and enforcement in Ohio and will appear in the
code in its entirety. New provisions in proposed rule 4101:1-1-01 provide general Rules of Construction
that apply to all proposed OBC, OMC, & OPC rules, such as replacing all references to “permit” in the
model codes with “approval,” to be consistent with how certain references, terms and phrases have
traditionally been applied in Ohio’s codes.

Reviewing Proposed Rules

The proposed rules will now only list provisions in the model codes that Ohio is deleting, modifying or
replacing. This will require comparison between the proposed Ohio rules to the model codes. To aid in
stakeholder review, below are examples of how to compare proposed model code documents with the
proposed rules. Stakeholders can view the base 2021 International Building, Mechanical & Plumbing
Codes for free on ICC’s website.

2021 International Building Code

2021 International Mechanical Code

2021 International Plumbing Code

Additional referenced standards are also available for review:

2021 International Energy Conservation Code

2021 International Fuel Gas Code

2021 International Existing Buildings Code

2021 International Fire Code



https://codes.ohio.gov/ohio-administrative-code
https://codes.ohio.gov/ohio-administrative-code
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/OHBC2017P5
https://www.iccsafe.org/
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IBC2021P2
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IMC2021P3
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IPC2021P3
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IECC2021P2
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IFGC2021P2
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IEBC2021P2
https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IFC2021P2

Example 1: No Ohio change. Model code to be adopted verbatim.

IBC Chapter 4 addresses “Special detailed requirements based on occupancy and use,” and proposed rule
4101:1-4-01 adopts all of IBC Chapter 4 except as modified in the rule.

IBC Section 404 addresses atriums:

D | 8 - intemations| Code Councl x | B CHAFTER 4 SPECIALDETALED . x | - o x
€ C @ O hps/d 2021p2/c pe ents-base upancy-and-useHBC2021P2_ChO_Secd04.2 A ot @ B8
£ Importfavrites | ) Ohio Bosrd OF B 1Bl Suggested Stes @ TeraView™ [ (SAFE)Weten Cont.. ) web authoring [ websuthoring [ () Howto Guidesfor.. [ Web Content At B otertnertes | g
=Menu Search across 2021 International Building Code (IBC) Q A o @ 2sionn +
5oE 5 2021 International Building Code (IBC) @ © upgrade to Premium °
AllCodes > 2021k-Codes < Second Version: Sep 2021 -
CHAPTER 4 SPECIAL DETAILED REQUIREMENTS BASED ON OCCUPANCY AND USE a
[Erp—
SECTION 404
CODE SECTIONS Y NOTES
! ATRIUMS G5 +

CHAPTER 4 SPECIAL DETAILED
» REQUIREMENTS BASED ON
OCCUPANCY AND USE

404.1 General. ()
The provisions of Sections 404.1 through 404.11 shall apply to buildings containing atriums - Atriums are not permitted in buildings or structures classified as Group H
» SECTION 401 SCOPE Exception: Vertical openings that comply with Sections 712.1.1 through 712.1.3, and Sections 712.1.9 through 712.1.14

SECTION 402 COVERED MALL

AND OPEN MALL BUILDINGS 404.2 Use.

‘The floor of the atrium shall not be used for other than low fire hazard uses and only approved materials and in with the Fire Code shall be used in the atrium space

SEENEBEEAEE Exception: The atrium floor area is permitted to be used for any approved use where the individual space is provided with an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1

BUILDINGS
» SECTION 404 ATRIUMS [F]404.3 Automatic sprinkler protection.
An approved automatic sprinkler system shall be installed throughout the entire building
404.1 General
Exceptions:
4042 Use 1. That area of a building adjacent to or above the atrium need not be sprinklered provided that portion of the building is separated from the atrium portion by not less than 2-hour fire barriers
constructed in accordance with Section 707 or horizontal assemblies constructed in accordance with Section 711, or both.
[F) 404.3 Automatic sprinkler 2. Where the ceiling of the atrium is more than 55 feet (16 764 mm) above the floor, sprinkler protection at the ceiling of the atrium is not required
protection

{F) 404 4 Fre tam system 1F] 4044 Fire alarm system.

A fire alarm system shall be provided in accordance with Section 907.2.14.

4045 Smoke control %
404.5 Smoke control. (3 E
AUEET LS A smoke control system shall be installed in accordance with Section 909 o
[F] 404.7 Standby power. Exceptions:
1. In other than Group I-2, and Group I-1, Condition 2, smoke control is not required for atriums that connect only two stories. <
CTIBIETTTAER 2. Asmoke control system is not required for atriums connecting more than two stories when all of the following are met ° o
1045 it accese ravel dstance 2.1, Only the two lowest stories shall be permitied to be open to the atrium H o
22. Al stories above the lowest two stories shall be separated from the atrium in accordance with the provisions for a shaft in Section 713.4. -

404.10 Exit stairways in an atrium.

Proposed rule 4101:1-4-01 does not list any modifications to Section 404.

%) OBC Ch 4 draft rule.pdf - Adobe Acrobat Pro (32-bit) - X
Fle £t View ESign Window Help

Home  Tools OBC Ch 4 draft rul.. X [ ON W )
Bw ® 8 Q DO 1 B OO - RT B2aDWQ a B e

Show next page (Right Arrow)|

4101:1-4-01 Special detailed requirements based on occupancy and use.

Chapter 4 of the International Building Code. 2021 edition. as incorporated by
reference and modified in Section 101.1 of this code. 1s further modified as
follows:

(A) Replace section 402.3 with the following:
402.3 Lease plan. Each owner of a covered mall building or of an open
mall building is to provide both the building and fire departments with a
lease plan. to the extent known. showing the location of each occupancy
and its exits before the certificate of occupancy has been issued. As a
condition of the certificate of occupancy. such plans are to be kept current

by the owner. Modifications or change of occupancy or use from that shown

on the lease plan are not to be made without prior approval of the building

official.

(B) Replace section 403.5.5 with the following:
403.5.5 Luminous egress path markings. When provided. luminous
egress path markings are to be installed in accordance with Section 1025.

(C) Modify section 405.1 as follows:
The first exception should read “Deleted.”

(D) Modify section 406.6.2 as follows:

The exception should read “Deleted.”

(E) Replace section 406.7 with the following:

Therefore, all of IBC Section 404 will appear in the code verbatim:



SECTION 404
ATRIUMS
404.1 General. The provisions of Sections 404.1 through 404.11 shall apply to buildings containing
atriums. Atriums are not permitted in buildings or structures classified as Group H.
Exception: Vertical openings that comply with Sections 712.1.1 through 712.1.3, and Sections 712.1.9
through 712.1.14.
404.2 Use. The floor of the atrium shall not be used for other than low fire hazard uses and only approved
materials and decorations in accordance with the International Fire Code shall be used in the atrium space.
Exception: The atrium floor area is permitted to be used for any approved use where the individual
space is provided with an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1.
[F] 404.3 Automatic sprinkler protection. An approved automatic sprinkler system shall be installed
throughout the entire building.
Exceptions:

1. That area of a building adjacent to or above the atrium need not be sprinklered provided that
portion of the building is separated from the atrium portion by not less than 2-hour fire barriers
constructed in accordance with Section 707 or horizontal assemblies constructed in accordance
with Section 711, or both.

2.  Where the ceiling of the atrium is more than 55 feet (16 764 mm) above the floor, sprinkler
protection at the ceiling of the atrium is not required.

[F] 404.4 Fire alarm system. A fire alarm system shall be provided in accordance with Section 907.2.14.
404.5 Smoke control. A smoke control system shall be installed in accordance with Section 909.
Exceptions:

1. In other than Group I-2, and Group I-1, Condition 2, smoke control is not required for atriums
that connect only two stories.

2. A smoke control system is not required for atriums connecting more than two stories when all
of the following are met:

2.1.0nly the two lowest stories shall be permitted to be open to the atrium.

2.2.All stories above the lowest two stories shall be separated from the atrium in accordance
with the provisions for a shaft in Section 713.4.

404.6 Enclosure of atriums. Atrium spaces shall be separated from adjacent spaces by a 1-hour fire barrier
constructed in accordance with Section 707 or a horizontal assembly constructed in accordance with
Section 711, or both.

Exceptions:

1. Afire barrier is not required where a glass wall forming a smoke partition is provided. The glass
wall shall comply with all of the following:

1.1. Automatic sprinklers are provided along both sides of the separation wall and doors, or on
the room side only if there is not a walkway on the atrium side. The sprinklers shall be
located between 4 inches and 12 inches (102 mm and 305 mm) away from the glass and at
intervals along the glass not greater than 6 feet (1829 mm). The sprinkler system shall be
designed so that the entire surface of the glass is wet upon activation of the sprinkler
system without obstruction;

1.2.The glass wall shall be installed in a gasketed frame in a manner that the framing system
deflects without breaking (loading) the glass before the sprinkler system operates; and

1.3.Where glass doors are provided in the glass wall, they shall be either self-closing or
automatic-closing.

2. Afire barrier is not required where a glass-block wall assembly complying with Section 2110 and
having a 3/4-hour fire protection rating is provided.



3. Afire barrier is not required between the atrium and the adjoining spaces of up to three floors
of the atrium provided that such spaces are accounted for in the design of the smoke control
system.

4. A fire barrier is not required between the atrium and the adjoining spaces where the atrium is
not required to be provided with a smoke control system.

5. A horizontal assembly is not required between the atrium and openings for escalators
complying with Section 712.1.3.

6. A horizontal assembly is not required between the atrium and openings for exit access stairways
and ramps complying with Item 4 of Section 1019.3.

[F] 404.7 Standby power. Equipment required to provide smoke control shall be provided with standby
power in accordance with Section 909.11.

404.8 Interior finish. The interior finish of walls and ceilings of the atrium shall be not less than Class B.
Sprinkler protection shall not result in a reduction in class.

404.9 Exit access travel distance. Exit access travel distance for areas open to an atrium shall comply with
the requirements of Section 1017. [

404.10 Exit stairways in an atrium. Where an atrium contains an interior exit stairway all the following
shall be met:

1. The entry to the exit stairway is the edge of the closest riser of the exit stairway.

2. The entry of the exit stairway shall have access from a minimum of two directions.

3. The distance between the entry to an exit stairway in an atrium and the entrance to a minimum of
one exit stairway enclosed in accordance with Section 1023.2 shall comply with the separation
required by Section 1007.1.1.

4, Exit access travel distance shall be measured to the closest riser of the exit stairway.

5. Not more than 50 percent of the exit stairways shall be located in the same atrium.

404.11 Interior exit stairway discharge. Discharge of interior exit stairways through an atrium shall be in
accordance with Section 1028.



Example 2: Ohio replaces model code language in its entirety.

IBC Chapter 5 addresses “General Building Heights and Areas,” and proposed rule 4101:1-5-01 adopts all
of IBC Chapter 5 except as modified in the rule.

IBC Section 506.3.1 addresses minimum percentage of perimeter:

O | [ ICC- intemationsl Code Councl x | B 2021 interation Buiding Cod x | & - x

< C @ @ hups/codesicesafeorg/conter

A - ® B @

B2 Import favorites Ohio Board Of Buil.. ] Suggested Sites @) Teal AFE) Wiitten Cont. [7) Other favorites
al 99

horing [ ©) Howto Guides or X

BC ol © w0 2smn

N Q
u cross 2 +
(]
AICodes » 2021 1Codes . S - 062

A;=Tabular allowable area factor (NS, S13R, S13D or SM value, as applicable) in accordance with Table 506.2 &

Legend Information NS = Tabular allowable area factor in accordance with Table 506.2 for a nonsprinklered building, regardiess of whether the building is sprinklered.
CODE TIONS NOTES Ir= Area factor increase due to frontage (percent) as calculated in accordance with Section 506.3. +

Exception: For buildings designed as separated occupancies under Section 508.4 and equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.2, the
CHAPTER 5 GENERAL BUILDING

e e s total building area shall be such that the aggregate sum of the ratios of the actual area of each story divided by the allowable area of such stories determined in accordance with Equation 5-3 based
- on the applicable provisions of Section 508.1, shall not exceed four

nal Building Co

SECTION 501 GENERAL
506.2.2.1 Group H-2 or H-3 mixed occupancies. (3 3
SECTION 502 BUILDING

Pt For a building containing Group H-2 or H-3 occupancies, the allowable area shall be determined in accordance with Section 508.4.2, with the automatic sprinkler system increase applicable only to

the portions of the building not classified as Group H-2 or H-3

SECTION 503 GENERAL -

» BUILDING HEIGHT AND AREA

506.3 Frontage increase. () G)
Every building shall adjoin or have access to a public way to receive an area factor increase based on frontage. Area factor increase shall be determined in accordance with Sections 506.3.1 through
SECTION 504 BUILDING HEIGHT
50633
AND NUMBER OF STORIES

506.3.1 Minimum percentage of perimeter. (J 3

MEZZANINES AND
T PLATFORMS To qualify for an area factor increase based on frontage, a building shall have not less than 25 percent of its perimeter on a public way or open space. Such open space shall be either on the same lot or
dedicated for public use and shall be accessed from a street or approved fire fane.

» SECTION 506 BUILDING AREA
506.3.2 Minimurn frontage distance. ()

To qualify for an area factor increase based on frontage, the public way or open space adjacent to the building perimeter shall have a minimum distance (W) of 20 feet (6096 mm) measured at right
angles from the building face to any of the following

» 506.1 General

» 506.2 Allowable area determination
1. The closest interior lot line.
06.3 Frontage increase 2. The entire width of a street, alley or public way.

3. The exterior face of an adjacent building on the same propery.
SECTION 507 UNLIMITED AREA

The frontage increase shall be based on the smallest public way or open space that is 20 feet (6098 mm) or greater, and the percentage of building perimeter having a minimum 20 feet (5096 mm)

BUILDINGS
public way or open space. -
<
, SECTION 508 MXED USEAND - (-)5
OCCUPANCY g
506.3.3 Amount of inerease. 3 = @
» SECTION 509 INCIDENTAL USES The area factor increase based on frontage shall be determined in accordance with Table 506.3 3 %

Proposed rule 4101:1-5-01 replaces IBC Section 506.3.1 in its entirety with Ohio language.

% OBC Ch 5 draft rule.pd - Adobe Acrobat Pro (32-bit) - 8 x
File Edit View E-Sign Window Help
Home  Tools 0BC Ch 5 draft rul. OBC Ch 5 draft rul.. X [ONY W )
w e B8 Q LRANEN SR U I C] S RT B2 aD Q a = e
ALLULUALIVL WILLL LIV ClldpivL U9 allu 11 \JIVUp INTL vLLupalivivy. o
h. In other than group R-2 occupancies. all new Group R occupancies are =
required to be protected by an automatic sprinkler system in accordance B
with Section 903.2.8. o
©) Modify Table 506.2, footnotes d and h as follows: 2
d. The NS value is only for use in evaluation of existing building height in 2
accordance with the Chapter 34 and in Group R-2 occupancies. B
h. In other than group R-2 occupancies. all new Group R occupancies are
required to be protected by an automatic sprinkler system in accordance
with Section 903.2.8.
, ‘
D) Replace Section 506.3.1 with the following: =
506.3.1 Minimum percentage of perimeter. To qualify for an area factor o}
increase based on frontage, a building will have not less than 25 percent %

of its perimeter on a public way or open space. Such open space is to be
either on the same lot or dedicated for public use and be accessed from a
street or approved fire lane. A fire lane is to have an unobstructed width
of not less than 20 feet (6096 mm). except for approved security gates
and an unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 13 feet 6 inches

(4115 mm).

Therefore, the IBC language will not appear in the code, but the Ohio language will:



506.3.1 Minimum percentage of perimeter. To qualify for an area factor increase based on frontage, a
building will have not less than 25 percent of its perimeter on a public way or open space. Such open space
is to be either on the same lot or dedicated for public use and be accessed from a street or approved fire
lane. A fire lane is an unobstructed width of not less than 20 feet (6096 mm), except for approved security
gates, and an unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 13 feet 6 inches (4115 mm).



Example 3: Ohio modifies model code in part.

IBC Chapter 9 addresses “Fire Protection and Life Safety Systems,” and proposed rule 4101:1-9-01
adopts all of IBC Chapter 9 except as modified in the rule.

IBC Section 903.2.6 addresses automatic sprinkler system requirements in Group | occupancies:

O | & (CC- Intemationsl Code Counel x | Bl 2021 nternationsl Buiding Code X | 4 )
€ C @ O npsscodesicesaterg/eontent A = @B B @
£3 importfavorites | O Ohio Bosrd Of8uil. 1B Suggested Stes @) TemaVie Web Content Auth ) Other fovorites
=Menu NN ternational Building Code (IBC) Q =) -.oo 2 signin
AllCodes » 2021 1-Codes
fhout dispensing Ordinary Hazard Group 2
Legend Information
Storage ith dispensing Extra Hazard Group 2
CODE SECTIONS >
Corridors Ordinary Hazard Group 2
N CHAPTER 9 FIRE PROTECTION
AND LIFE SAFETY SYSTEMS
[F] 903.2.5.3 Pyroxylin plastics.
P SEEIENE]EEER An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided in buildings, or portions thereof, where cellulose nitrate film or pyroxylin plastics are manufactured, stored or handled in quantities exceeding 100
pounds (45 kg)
SECTION 902 FIRE PUMP AND
RISER ROOM SIZE
[F]903.2.6 Group |
, SECTION 903 AUTOMATIC An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings with a Group | ire area.
SPRINKLER SYSTEMS one:
Exceptions:
> [F]903.1 General 1. An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.2 shall be permitted in Group I-1, Condition 1 facilties.
2. An automatic sprinkler system is not required where Group |-4 day care faciliies are at the level of exit discharge and where every room where care is provided has not fewer than one
> [F]903.2 Where required exterior exit door.
3. In buildings where Group I-4 day care s provided on levels other than the level of exit discharge, an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 shall be installed on the
v [FERZIETR entire floor where care is provided, all floors between the level of care and the level of exit discharge, and all floors below the level of exit discharge other than areas classified as an open
parking garage
[F] 903.2.2 Ambulatory care
facilities.
[F1903.2.7 Group M. COP P (3 (3 3 0 €33 0 G 0 €3 0 €3
[F1908.2.3 Group E. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings containing a Group M occupancy where one of the following conditions exists
R 1. A Group M fire area exceeds 12,000 square feet (1115 m?)
» [F]903.2.4 Group -1
2. AGroup M fire area is located more than three stories above grade plane
» [F19032.5 Group H 3. The combined area of all Group M fire areas on all floors, including any mezzanines, exceeds 24,000 square feet (2230 m?)
[F]903.2.6 Group |.
[F]903.2.7.1 High-piled storage. =
> [F1903.2.7 Group M.
[F1903.2.7 Group An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided in accordance with the International Fire Code in all buildings of Group M where storage of merchandise is in high-piled o rack storage arrays ° %
w
» [F]903.2.8 Group R E

[F] 903.2.7.2 Group M upholstered furniture or mattresses.
» [F]903.2.9 Group S-1 An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout a Group M fire area where the area used for the display and sale of upholstered furniture or mattresses exceeds 5,000 square feet (464

Proposed rule 4101:1-5-01 modifies IBC Section 903.2.6 in part with Ohio language:

% 0BC Ch 9 draft rule.pdf - Adobe Acrobat Pro (32-bit) -

Fle Edt View ESgn Window Help

Home  Tools OBC Ch 5 dratt rul. OBC Ch 5 draft rul, OBC Ch 9 draft rul.. X B O A
w e 8 Q ®© 24+ MO G M~ A A = V7 S A i ) & =

—

Exception: An automatic sprinkler system is not required throughout
Group E day care facilities that provide care for more than five but no
more than 100 children 2 % vyears or less of age where the day care
facilities are at the level of exit discharge and where every room where
care is provided for children that are less than or equal to 2 ' years of age
has no fewer than one exterior exit door for which the exit access and exit
discharge do not include the traversing of stairs.

() Modify section 903.2.6 to add the following phrase at the end of exception

for which the exit access and exit discharge do not require the traversing of
stairs.

J) Modify section 903.2.8 to add an exception that reads as follows:
Exception: Group R-2. An automatic sprinkler system is not required in
buildings of Group R-2 permitted to have a single exit per Section 1006.3.4
where:

1. The building is not used as an “SRO” occupancy as defined in Chapter 2
and

2. The exit is constructed as an exterior exit stairway per Section 1027, and
3. The dwelling units egress directly into an exit, and

Therefore, Section 903.2.6 will appear in the code as follows:



903.2.6 Group |. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout buildings with a Group | fire

area.
Exceptions:

1. An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.2 shall be
permitted in Group I-1, Condition 1 facilities.

2. An automatic sprinkler system is not required where Group I-4 day care facilities are at the
level of exit discharge and where every room where care is provided has not fewer than one
exterior exit door for which the exit access and exit discharge do not require the traversing of
stairs.

3. In buildings where Group |-4 day care is provided on levels other than the level of exit

discharge, an automatic sprinkler system in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 shall be
installed on the entire floor where care is provided, all floors between the level of care and
the level of exit discharge, and all floors below the level of exit discharge other than areas
classified as an open parking garage.



Example 4: Ohio deletes entire section of model code language. The section will

not apply in Ohio.

IBC Chapter 33 addresses “Safeguards During Construction,” and proposed rule 4101:1-33-01 adopts all
of IBC Chapter 33 except as modified by the rule.

IBC Section 3303 address demolition:

O | @ iccsafe-Search

< C @

£ Import favarites

CODE SECTIONS MY N

= DIGITAL
=Menu i

CHAPTER 32 ENCROACHMENTS
INTO THE PUBLIC RIGHT-OF-WAY

CHAPTER 33 SAFEGUARDS
DURING CONSTRUCTION

SECTION 3301 GENERAL

SECTION 3302 CONSTRUCTION
SAFEGUARDS

SECTION 3303 DEMOLITION

3303.1 Construction documents.

3303.2 Pedestrian protection.

3303.3 Means of egress.

3303.4 Vacant lot

3303.5 Water accumulation.

3303.6 Utility connections.

3303 7 Fire safety during
demalition

SECTION 3304 SITE WORK

SECTION 3305 SANITARY

SECTION 3306 PROTECTION OF
PEDESTRIANS

SECTION 3307 PROTECTION OF

g ADJOINING PROPERTY

SECTION 3308 TEMPORARY USE
OF STREETS, ALLEYS AND
PUBLIC PROPERTY

(O Ohio Board OF Buil...

% | B ICC- Intemational Code Council % | [ CHAPTER 33 SAFEGUARDS DUR! X | + = a X

(%)  https://codes.iccsafe.org/content/IBC2021P2/chapter-33-safeguards-during-construction#IBC2021P2_Ch33 Sec... AY = s @ -
I3 Suggested Sites ™ [ (SAFE) Written Cont.. () web authoriing [ webauthoring [ > | B Other favorites q,

Q a8 go @ Lsionn +

2021 International Building Code (IBC) Upgrade to Premium Sarond Version Sep 2021 . L]

CHAPTER 23 SAFEGUARDS DURING CONSTRUCTION

Fire safety during construction shall comply with the applicable requirements of this code and the applicable provisions of Chapter 33 of the International Fire
Code.

+
SECTION 3303
DEMOLITION
33031 Construction documents.
Construction documernts and a schedule for demolition shall be submitted where required by the building official. Where such information is required, work
shall net be done until such gonstruction documents or schedule, or both, are approved.
3303.2 Pedestrian protection.
The work of demolishing any building shall not be commenced until pedestrian protection is in place as required by this chapter.
3303.3 Means of egress,
A honzontal exit shall not be destroyed unless and until a substitute means of egress has been provided and approved.
33034 Vacant lot.
Where a structure has been demolished or removed, the vacant lot shall be filled and maintained to the existing grade or in accordance with the ordinances of
the jurisdiction having authority.
3303.5 Water accumulation. (533
Provision shall be made to prevent the accumulation of water or damage to any foundations on the premises or the adjoining property.
3303.6 Utility connections.
Service utility connections shall be discontinued and capped in accordance with the approved rules and the requirements of the applicable governing
authority
3303.7 Fire safety during demolition.
Fire safety during demolition shall comply with the applicable requirements of this code and the applicable provisions of Chapter 33 of the Infemnational Fire
Code.
K
SECTION 3304 ° 3
SITE WORK E &
=
3304.1 Excavation and fill. 5@

Excavation and fill for bui




Proposed rule 4101:1-33-01 deletes IBC Section 3303 in its entirety:

2 osc o~
Fle Edt View ESgn Window Help

Home  Tools OBC Ch 33 draft ru... X

B O A
B % ® 8 Q ®O© MNP OO - T BLaDTQ

4101:1-33-01 Safeguards during construction.

Chapter 33 of the International Building Code. 2021 edition. as incorporated by

reference and modified in Section 101.1.1 of this code. is further modified as
follows:

(A)Replace section 3301.2.1 to read:
3301.2.1 Structural and construction loads. Deleted.

(B) Replace section 3302 in its entirety with the following:
SECTION 3302 CONSTRUCTION SAFEGUARDS
This section and all subsections are deleted.

(C)Replace section 3303 in its entirety with the following:
SECTION 3303 DEMOLITION
This section and all subsections are deleted.

(D)Replace section 3305 in its entiretv with the following:
SECTION 3305 SANITARY
This section and all subsections are deleted.

(E) Replace section 3308 in its entiretv with the following:

SECTION 3308 TEMIPORARY USE OF STREETS. ALLEYS
AND PUBLIC PROPERTY

This section and all subsections are deleted.

(F) Replace section 3314 in its entirety with the following:
SECTION 3314 FIRE WATCH DURING CONSTRUCTON —
This section and all subsections are deleted.

Therefore, Section 3303 will appear in the code as follows:

SECTION 3303 Demolition
This section and all subsections are deleted.



Example 5: Ohio deletes subsection of model code language. The subsection will
not apply in Ohio.

IBC Chapter 17 addresses “Special Inspections and Tests,” and proposed rule 4101:1-17-01 adopts all of
IBC Chapter 17 except as modified in the rule.

IBC Section 1704.6.1 addresses structural observations for structures:

O | i 1CC- Intemstions! Code Counc: X | | 2021 Internstonsl Builing Code X | 4 - o x
€ C @ A T @ B8

£ Import favortes

@ httpsy/codesiccsaferg

O OhioBoara Of Bui.. B Suggested Site I Content Auth.

£) Other favorites

R O Howto Guides for.

Q
=Menu earch a Q @ 11)00 2 signin +
(-]
AllCodes » 2021 I-Codes <
4. Reports of tests for shotcrete in with ACI 318 a
Legend Information 5. Certificates of compliance for open web steel joists and joist girders in accordance with Section 2207.5
ECTIONS s 6. Reports of material properties verifying compliance with the requirements of AWS D1.4 for weldability as specified in Section 26.6.4 of ACI 318 for reinforcing bars in concrete complying with a s
B standard other than ASTM A706 that are to be welded
CHAPTER 17 SPECIAL e
D NEEe B e D R 7. Reports of mill tests in accordance with Section 20.2.25 of ACI 318 for reinforcing bars complying with ASTM AG15 and used to resist earthquake-induced flexural or axial forces in the special
moment frames, special structural walls or coupling beams connecting special structural walls of seismic force-resisting systems in structures assigned to Seismic Design Category B, C, D, E or F.
» SECTION 1701 GENERAL
17046 Structural observations. (3 33 (3 E3 0 C3 0 €2 0 €3 0 €3 0 €3
b SECTION 1702 NEW MATERIALS Where required by the provisions of Section 1704.6.1, the owner or the owner’s authorized agent shall employ a registered design professional to perform structural observations. The structural observer
shall visually observe representative locations of structural systems, details and load paths for general conformance to the approved construction documents. Structural observation does not include or
o SEEIEN TR AERRRIALE waive the responsibility for the inspections in Section 110 or the special inspections in Section 1705 or other sections of this code. Prior to the commencement of observations, the structural observer shall
eeTioN 1704 SpECIAL submitto the building official a written statement identifying the frequency and extent of structural observations. At the conclusion of the work included in the permit, the structural observer shall submit to the
T
A building official a written statement that the site visits have been made and identify any reported deficiencies that, to the best of the structural observer's knowledge, have not been resolved
» CONTRACTOR RESPONSIBILITY
AND STRUCTURAL 1704.6.1 Structural observations for structures. (3 3 (0 33 0 G2 0 G2 0 G2 0 G2 0 €3
CREAE] Structural observations shall be provided for those structures where one or more of the following conditions exist
T e 1. The structure is classified as Risk Category Il or IV.
2. The structure is a high-rise building
, 17042 Special inspections and 3. The structure is assigned to Seismic Design Category E, and is greater than two stories above the grade plane
=B 4. Such observation is required by the registered design professional responsible for the structural design
5. Such observation is specifically required by the building official.
, 17043 Statement of special
inspections. -
1704.4 Contractor responsibilty. SECTION 1705 <
2
REQUIRED SPECIAL INSPECTIONS AND TESTS B @B 0068 2
17045 Submittals to the building 2
official &
17051 General. C23 E23 E3 €3 €3 €3 €3
» 17046 Structural observations. Special inspections and tests of elements and nonstructural components of buildings and structures shall meet the applicable requirements of this section. g
=
OF
ECTION 1705 REQUIRED w
1705.1.1 Special cases.
» SPECIAL INSPECTIONS AND pect G2 G2 € G0 & €0 2 E GD
TESTS Special inspections and tests shall be required for proposed work that is, in the opinion of the building official, unusual in its nature, such as, but not limited to, the following examples
1. Construction materials and systems that are alternatives to materials and systems prescribed by this code: &

Proposed rule 4101:1-17-01 deletes condition #5 from IBC 1704.6.1:

%) OBC Ch 17 draft rule.pdf - Adobe Acrobat Pro (32-bit) - X
Home  Tools 0BC Ch 17 draft ru. 0BC Ch 17 draftru.. [ONY W
w® 8 Q ® s MNP =BT B 2aDWQ a = e
Exception: The statement of special inspections is permitted to be ~ e
prepared by a qualified person approved by the building official for 2]
construction not designed by a registered design professional if the 2]
qualified person provides written documentation to the building official =
demonstrating his or her competence and relevant experience or training. 2
4
(G) Modifyv Section 1704.6.1, condition #S to read as follows: B
5. Deleted.
, ‘

(H) Modify Section 1705.6 to add a new exception that reads as follows:

o B

2. A geotechnical investigation is not required where satisfactory data
from adjacent areas is available that demonstrates an investigation is not
necessary for any of the conditions in Sections 1803.5.1 through
1803.5.6 and Section 1803.5.10.

A

(I) Add new section 1705.21 to read as follows:

1705.21 Medium/high voltage svstems. Special inspections are to be
conducted for medium and high voltage electrical systems to determine
*

11



Therefore, Section 1704.6.1 will appear in the code as follows and the requirement for observation by
the building official is not an option in Ohio:

1704.6.1 Structural observations for structures. Structural observations shall be provided for those
structures where one or more of the following conditions exist:

1. The structure is classified as Risk Category Il or IV.

2. The structure is a high-rise building.

3. The structure is assigned to Seismic Design Category E, and is greater than two stories above the

grade plane.

4. Such observation is required by the registered design professional responsible for the structural
design.

5. Deleted.

12



Example 6: Ohio only language. Provisions do not appear in model code.

IBC Chapter 31 addresses “Special Construction,” and proposed rule 4101:1-31-01 adopts all of IBC
Chapter 31 except as modified in the rule.

IBC Chapter 31 includes Sections 3101 through 3115, but does not have a section 3116. Proposed rule
4101:1-31-01, in addition to other modifications, adds section 3116 pursuant to Revised Code Section
3791.21 which requires the Board to adopt rules for refuse containers:

) 0BC Ch 31 draft
File Edit View

Acrobat Pro (32-bit) - o x
Help

enaramtnl | oscon st anm x O A®
Y P8 Q ® s R MO 3T B2 aD@mQ a =5

Home  Tools

(D Add section 3116 to read as follows: B
SECTION 3116 REFUSE CONTAINERS o

3116.1 General. Pursuant to sections 3791.21 and 3791.99 of the
Revised Code. this section prescribes the safety standards for refuse
containers which are self-dumping by means of a specially designed
front, side or rear loading vehicle.
3116.2 Purpose. The purpose of prescribing safety standards for the
manufacture, construction, installation, or redesign of refuse containers
is to ensure that they will not tip over if persons climb in or on the refuse
container.
3116.3 Standards. All newly manufactured or installed refuse
containers and all existing refuse containers, as described in Section
3116.1, are to be tested and comply with the testing conditions and
procedures of the “Consumer Product Safety Act Regulations, 16 C.F.R.
1301.”
3116.4 Enforcement. The jurisdiction may adopt ordinances to provide

for the enforcement of the provisions of Section 3116.3.

& O R

Therefore, Section 3116 will appear in the code as follows:

SECTION 3116 REFUSE CONTAINERS
3116.1 General. Pursuant to sections 3791.21 and 3791.99 of the Revised Code, this section prescribes
the safety standards for refuse containers which are self-dumping by means of a specially designed front,
side or rear loading vehicle.
3116.2 Purpose. The purpose of prescribing safety standards for the manufacture, construction,
installation, or redesign of refuse containers is to ensure that they will not tip over if persons climb in or
on the refuse container.
3116.3 Standards. All newly manufactured or installed refuse containers and all existing refuse
containers, as described in Section 3116.1, are to be tested and comply with the testing conditions and
procedures of the “Consumer Product Safety Act Regulations, 16 C.F.R. 1301.”
3116.4 Enforcement. The jurisdiction may adopt ordinances to provide for the enforcement of the
provisions of Section 3116.3.

13


https://codes.ohio.gov/ohio-revised-code/section-3791.21
https://codes.ohio.gov/ohio-revised-code/section-3791.21

Example 7: Entire chapter of model adopted. No Ohio changes.

IBC Chapter 21 addresses “Masonry,” and proposed rule 4101:1-21-01 adopts all of IBC Chapter 21
without any Ohio modifications.

B osccnar apet-
Fle Edt View ESign Window Hep

Home  Tools OBC Ch 21 draft ru.. X

B % ® 8 Q ®© R BOO - BT BLAaDTQ G4 =

4101:1-21-01 Masonry.
Chapter 21 of the International Building Code, 2021 edition. is incorporated by

reference and modified in Section 101.1.1 of this code.

Therefore, IBC Chapter 21 will appear in the code verbatim.

14



